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1ea.
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short bed (no fenders) extended, club, super UNIT PRICE *
cab pickup trucks, per specifications TOTAL 22,437.00 22,447.00 22,607.00
A. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 Ford F150 4XL Ford F150 Supercab 2013 Ram 1500
1 ea.
9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and long type bed (no fender outside) crew-cab/ UNIT PRICE *
quad-cab pickup truck, per specifications TOTAL 36,093.00 36,337.00
B. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 Ford F250 4x4 Ford F250 4x4 NO BID
2 ea. *
9,900 GVWR (minimum) single rear wheel, two wheel drive, regular cab truck UNIT PRICE 35,411.00 34,940.00
with installed service body, complete, per specifications TOTAL 70,822.00 69,880.00
C. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 F250 wi/serv. Body Ford F250 NO BID
1ea.
19,000 GVWR (minimum) 4-door, crew cab truck with mounted fiberglass utility UNIT PRICE *
body and 2,000 Ib. crane, complete, per specifications TOTAL 68,613.00 67,425.00
D. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 Ford F550 4x2 Ford F550 crew cab NO BID
15 ea. *
9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short type bed (no feder outside) extended club, [unitPrice 37,741.00 38,630.00
super cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL 566,115.00 579,450.00
E. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 Ford 4x4 Ford F250 4x4 NO BID
2 ea. *
9,900 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 extended cab, wide and long bed, single rear wheels UNIT PRICE 33,037.00 34,225.00
pickup trucks with 1,300 liftgate, complete, per specifications TOTAL 66,074.00 68,450.00
F. State Make and Model makemmoper | 2013 Ford Supercab 4x2 | Ford F250 supercab 4x2 NO BID
1 ea.
9,000 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and long type bed (no fender outside) crew-cab/ UNIT PRICE *
quad-cab pickup truck, complete, per specifications TOTAL 40,039.00 41,335.00
G. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 Ford F250 4x4 Ford F250 4x4 crew cab NO BID
2 ea. *
6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and long bed (no outside fenders), extended, club, UNIT PRICE 22,111.00 21,976.00
super cab pickup trucks, complete, per specifications TOTAL 44,222.00 43,952.00
H. State Make and Model MAKE/MODEL 2013 Ford F150 4x2 Ford F150 4x2 NO BID
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Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days
*DENOTES LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS WERE MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Alamo Toyota Holiday Ford Demandstar
Ancira Motor Co. Jennings Anderson Ford SAWS Website

Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge
Brown Chevrolet

Caldwell Country Ford
Cavender Chevrolet

Columbus Country

Dodge Superstor

Grande Ford

Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep

Jordan Ford

Planet Ford

Red McCombs Dodge

Red McCombs Toyota/Ford
Southway Ford

Tom Benson Chevrolet
Universal Toyota




